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Extremely original plot. 
Your crime report is 
unique and will become 
a milestone in the 
seventh art.

There are not many 
crimes like yours out 
there. Your story is fairly 
original, and this type of 
plots is what novels, 
films and TV series need

Not the most original 
crime out there, but 
most ideas have already 
been taken so it is very 
difficult to come up with 
something totally new.

Maybe your team 
should have put more 
effort into finding an 
original topic for your 
crime. You can do better 
than this.

There are tons of stories 
like this one already. You 
are not providing 
anything new. Try 
harder!

A thoroughly organized 
police report that 
contains an outstanding 
display of text and 
photos that look like real 
police/medical 
documents.

Organized documents 
and an attractive 
combination of text and 
images. The story is easy 
to understand just 
following your 
documents.

Your organization is 
pretty straightforward. 
Maybe you should have 
included a few more 
images to make your 
documents even clearer.

Your report is not the 
most straightforward in 
the world, but it works. A 
bit less chaos would be 
appreciated, though.

If we pay attention to 
police films, chaos is 
part of their lives. 
However, their reports 
need to have some 
order to be able to find 
crucial information.

Your dossier contains all 
the documents 
necessary for a crime 
investigation. The 
information you provide 
is scientifically accurate.

Your dossier contains 
most documents 
necessary for a crime 
investigation. The 
information included is 
more or less precise.

Interesting information 
and correct length. You 
would only need a little 
extra effort to turn your 
story into a masterpiece.

The information is more 
or less interesting, but 
your documents are very 
few or very short to 
actually understand your 
story.

The number of 
documents is too low or 
the information 
provided is too short to 
be considered fit for 
your case.

It is very clear that the 
story has been written 
by scientists. It contains 
a good number of 
accurate scientific 
elements and 
techniques.

A comprehensive set of 
scientific techniques is 
present in the story. 
Scientists generally write 
good stories.

Good balance between 
action and science. 
Considering the course 
is based on forensic 
techniques you might 
want to include a few 
more of them in your 
story.

You have focused more 
on the crime than on the 
scientific elements of 
your story. It would be 
clever to show your 
teacher you have learnt 
a lot in class, don’t you 
think?

Your scientific contents 
are not relevant or 
original, either because 
they have been copied 
from somewhere or 
because they have been 
used a million times 
before.

Perfect use of complex 
language structures and 
technical vocabulary 
with no errors.

Good use of mostly 
simple structures 
including technical 
vocabulary with few 
errors.

Average use of simple 
structures and technical 
vocabulary. Your texts 
contains some errors or 
language is a bit basic. 
You will need to improve 
on language complexity.

Your documents need 
deep revising. You 
should read each others' 
texts before posting 
them to prevent errors.

Many basic errors that 
could have been 
avoided using an 
automatic corrector. Not 
good enough.
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